
DERRY TOWNSHIP MID-MONTHLY MEETING 

AGENDA 

March 2, 2026 
 Announcement – The following meeting will be recorded for note-taking purposes only.  The recording will be destroyed after the official 

Minutes are prepared. 

 

1. Call Meeting to Order  
 

2. Approve Minutes of the February 2, 2026 Liquor License Hearing and the February 2, 2026 Mid-Month Meeting. 
 

3. Award of Bid – Road Materials 

 
 

4. Award of Bid – Pipe 

 
 

5. Solicitor 

 

6. Visitors 

 

7.  Public Comment 

 

8. Roadmaster 

 

9. Old Business 

a. Release of MCSD – Athletic Field Escrow Account balance - $3,675.77 

 

10.  New Business 

a. Anonymous complaint – Standard Steel trucks depositing dirt and mud out onto Township roads 

b. Kuharchik Construction – Proposal to perform Highway Lighting Maintenance 

c. TWG Security – Proposal to replace aging ACM/ACC Security Servers & Software - $32,905.63 

d. Approval to transfer $200,000 from Payroll Account to higher interest Money Market account 

 

11. Meetings: 
 

 

12. Adjournment 

HEI-WAY, LLC **

PLANT

 DELIVERED 

STOCKPILE 

 DELIVERED AS 

DIRECTED PLANT

 DELIVERED 

STOCKPILE 

 DELIVERED AS 

DIRECTED 

9.5 mm 74.00                       NO BID NO BID 9.5 mm

19 mm 69.00                       NO BID NO BID 19 mm

25 mm 67.00                       NO BID NO BID 25 mm

UPM UPM 99.00                       137.00                    NO BID

2RC 10.75                       15.27                       17.36                       2RC

2B 17.50                       22.02                       24.11                       2B

1B 16.00                       20.52                       22.61                       1B

ANTI-SKID/Type AS1 10.00                       14.52                       16.61                       ANTI-SKID/Type AS1

2A STONE 11.50                       16.02                       18.11                       2A STONE

GABION STONE 15.00                       19.52                       21.61                       GABION STONE

NOTE ** LOW BIDDER/SUBMITTED DELIVERY BIDNOTE* JAY FULKROAD & SON'S ARE SLIGHTLY LOWER FOR 9.5 MM, 19 MM & 25 MM 

STONE BUT THEIR PLANT IS A GREATER DISTANCE FROM TOWNSHIP AND WOULD 

RESULT IN HIGHER TRANSPORT COSTS.

G O HAWBAKER, INC. *

Chemung Supply Corp.   ---
ITEMS DELIVERED
10" Galvanized corrugated metal pipe* 16 guage
12" Galvanized corrugated metal pipe * 16 guage 19.00        
15" Galvanized corrugated metal pipe * 16 guage 21.00        
18" Galvanized corrugated metal pipe * 16 guage 26.00        
24" Galvanized corrugated metal pipe * 16 guage 32.00        
* bands same price as one foot of pipe

10" plastic 11.74        
12" plastic 12.46        
15" plastic 17.83        
18" plastic 23.78        

24" plastic 38.51        

connecting bands 10" 8.49           

connecting bands 12" 9.57           

connecting bands 15" 15.95        

connecting bands 18" 27.18        

connecting bands 24" 38.32        

Thurs., March 5 D. T. Planning Commission Mtg Derry Twp Mun Bldg 4:00 pm 

Wed., March 11 Fame EMS Fame Headquarters 11:00 am 

Thurs., March 12 MCRPD Meeting Derry Twp Mun Bldg 4:30 pm 

Tues., Feb 17 Twp Mid-Month Meeting Derry Twp Mun Bldg 5:30 pm 


